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Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request about medical locums and
agency nursing. Please find the Trust’s response below.

1. Please confirm what frameworks are used to source medical locum doctors.
HTE Lot 3A Framework.

2. Please confirm what frameworks are used to source agency nurses. HTE Framework

3. Please confirm if there are any contractual relationship in place to source medical locum doctors.
We use the liaison system — Tempre to source medical locum doctors for particular vacancies.

4 Please confirm if there are any contractual relationship in place to source agency nurses. No

5. Please confirm your current procurement/HR personnel and contact details for the procurement of
medical locum doctors.
Gloucestershire NHS Procurement Shared services
http://www.gloshospitals.nhs.uk/en/Wards-and-Departments/Other-
Departments/glosprocure/reggr/

6. Please confirm your current procurement/HR personnel and contact details for the procurement of
agency nurses. Richard Hall - Temporary Staff Resourcing Manager — Richard.hall16@nhs.net

7. Please confirm the spend on medical locum doctors for the financial year 2016/2017.
e Can this be broken down by agency. Please see attached spreadsheet.
e Can this be broken down by speciality. The Trust does not hold this information.

8. Please confirm the spend on agency nurses for the financial year 2016/2017.
e Can this be broken down by agency. Please see attached spreadsheet.
e Can this be broken down by speciality. The Trust does not hold this information.

Should you have any queries in relation to our response in this letter, please do not hesitate
to contact me. If you are unhappy with the response you have received in relation to your
request and wish to ask us to review our response, you should write to:-

Anna Hilditch
Assistant Trust Secretary,
gether NHS Foundation Trust
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E-mail: anna.hilditch@nhs.net

If you are not content with the outcome of any review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for further advice/guidance. Generally, the ICO
will not consider your case unless you have exhausted your enquiries with the Trust which
should include considering the use of the Trust's formal complaints procedure. The ICO
can be contacted at: The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.

Yours sincerely,
%){1 %Zf(mo’

LISA EVANS
Information Governance Officer
2gether NHS Foundation Trust

Copyright & Reuse of Public Sector Information

The information and material that is routinely published is subject to gether NHS Foundation Trust's
copyright unless otherwise indicated. Unless expressly indicated on the material to the contrary, it may be
reproduced free of charge in any format or medium, provided it is reproduced accurately and not used in a
misleading manner. Where any of the copyright items are being re-published or copied to others, you must
identify the source of the material and acknowledge the copyright status. Permission to reproduce material
does not extend to any material accessed through the Trust website that is the copyright of third parties.
You must obtain authorisation to reproduce such material from the copyright holders concerned. For further
guidance on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI) web site:
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm

or write to: OPSI, 102 Petty France, London SW1H 9AJ.
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Question 7

MEDICAL LOCUM SPEND 2016/17 WITH VENDOR DETAILS

Vendor Name Value (£)
Athona Limited 82,192.85
Cotswold District Council 4,632.00
Doctors on Call Limited 596,325.51
JG 251.06
DRC Locums Limited 8,321.60
Drs Direct Limited 177,168.00
Evergood Associates Limited 116,426.75
GDN Recruitment t/a National Locums 102,795.85
Global Medics Limited 15,993.68
Glos Hospitals NHS FT 115,684.96
H & L Medical Limited 74,357.14
Holt Doctors Limited 25,893.86
ID Medical Group Limited 157,807.82
InterAct Medical 315,863.30
JH 950.00
Maxxima Ltd 19,612.52
Medacs Healthcare Services PLC 183,874.00
Network Ventures Limited 8,775.00
Premier Endoscopy Ltd 6,358.51
ProMedical Personnel Limited 71,620.62
Pulse Healthcare Limited 176,830.19
Wye Valley NHS Trust 2,629.68
Trust employed Locum Staff 674,328.30
Internal accruals (2015/16 b/fwd etc) -222,825.43
TOTAL MEDICAL LOCUM SPEND 2016/17| 2,715,867.77

N.B. Value per agency relates to invoices paid in 2016/17 regardless of when the service was
delivered, hence the need to include accrual adjustments etc.




FOIl 258HS-1718 Question 8

NURSING AGENCY SPEND 2016/17 WITH VENDOR DETAILS

Vendor Name Value (£)
4SocialWork 24,370.93
Acorn Recruitment Limited 84,945.12
Cromwell Medical Staffing Limited 41,575.35
Drs Direct Limited 23,156.28
Glos Hospitals NHS FT 7,266.00
Herefordshire County Council - 187.39
Just Recruit Group Limited 5,5622.87
Mayday Healthcare PLC 1,895.01
Meridian Business Support Ltd 31,092.10
MSI Recruitment Ltd 8,988.77
Paterson Group (Healthcare) 28,750.52
Prestige Fleet Servicing Ltd - 2,131.90
Prestige Nursing Limited 80,666.69
Primera Assisted Living Limited 394,512.54
Pulse Healthcare Limited 326,165.66
Sanctuary Personnel Ltd 108,297.56
TFS Healthcare 536,426.28
Thornbury Nursing Services Limited 752,743.80
Travail Employment Group 610.80
Internal accruals (2015/16 b/fwd etc) -75,352.39
TOTAL NURSING AGENCY SPEND 2,379,314.60

N.B. Value per agency relates to invoices paid in 2016/17 regardless of when the
service was delivered, hence the need to include accrual adjustments etc.
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