2geth
Zg e.th e r NHS FoundatiogneTrues[ m

Making life better

Trust HQ
Rikenel
Montpellier
Gloucester
GL1 1LY

Direct Tel: 01452 894266
E-mail: 2gnft.Information-Freedom@nhs.net
Website: www.2gether.nhs.uk

30 August 2017
Freedom of Information Request — Ref: FOI 120-1718

Thank you for your recent Freedom of Information request about early intervention services.
Please find the Trust’s response below.

1. What was your annual Early Intervention in Psychosis (EIP) budget for (a) 2016-17 and (b) 2017-18?
a) 2016/17 Operational Budget for El = £1,342,841
b) 2017/18 Operational Budget for El = £1,373,870

2. a) How many people accessed EIP services in 2016-17;

77

2. (b) How many people are estimated to access EIP services in 2017-18?
The Trust does not hold this information.

3. (a) What was the average EIP investment per patient in 2016-17; (b) What is the estimated EIP
investment per patient in 2017-18?
The Trust does not hold this information.

4. What age range has your EIP service been commissioned to cover in 2017-18?
14-65 although not seeing over 35’s at this time.

5. What eligibility criteria/restrictions does your EIP service have in place for referrals over the age of
357
N/A - see above.

6. What was the (a) mean and (b) longest waiting time from referral to treatment in your EIP service in
2016-177

(a)

Average of Days to Treatment 17.2

(b)

Max of Days to Treatment 77
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7. a) Of those accessing EIP in 2016-17, what percentage received cognitive behavioural therapy for
psychosis (CBTp)? b) Of those who received CBTp, what was the average number of sessions
received?

a) 41%
b) The Trust does not hold information.

8. Of those accessing EIP in 2016-17, what percentage of individuals and their families received Family
Interventions?
The Trust does not hold this information.

9. Of those accessing EIP in 2016-17, what percentage of patients received a comprehensive physical
health check?

% Physical Health Check 43%

10. Of those accessing EIP in 2016-17, what percentage of those who were reported to be smokers were
referred to Smoking Cessation services?
The Trust does not hold this information.

11. Of those accessing EIP in 2016-17, what percentage of those who were not in employment or
education received Individual Placement and Support?

29%

Note: Figures for Herefordshire are not available, the above figure is for Gloucestershire only.12%
of patients in denominator above are recorded as Long Term Sick and 30% have no employment
status recorded.

12. Is your EIP team able to deliver the full NICE-concordant packages of care, in accordance with
national guidelines, to all patients referred to the EIP service?
The team is working with the South Region support team to ensure the team has appropriate
support and training to deliver this- progress in monitored through the Time 4 Recovery EIP
Matrix and CCQIl Assessment.

Should you have any queries in relation to our response in this letter, please do not hesitate
to contact me. If you are unhappy with the response you have received in relation to your
request and wish to ask us to review our response, you should write to:-

Anna Hilditch

Assistant Trust Secretary,
gether NHS Foundation Trust
Rikenel

Montpellier

GLOUCESTER GL1 1LY
Tel: 01452 894165

E-mail: anna.hilditch@nhs.net

If you are not content with the outcome of any review, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for further advice/guidance. Generally, the ICO
will not consider your case unless you have exhausted your enquiries with the Trust which
should include considering the use of the Trust’'s formal complaints procedure. The ICO
can be contacted at: The Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire SK9 5AF.
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Yours sincerely,
%a (;mezf)’
LISA EVANS

Information Governance Officer
’gether NHS Foundation Trust

Copyright & Reuse of Public Sector Information

The information and material that is routinely published is subject to “gether NHS Foundation Trust's
copyright unless otherwise indicated. Unless expressly indicated on the material to the contrary, it may be
reproduced free of charge in any format or medium, provided it is reproduced accurately and not used in a
misleading manner. Where any of the copyright items are being re-published or copied to others, you must
identify the source of the material and acknowledge the copyright status. Permission to reproduce material
does not extend to any material accessed through the Trust website that is the copyright of third parties.
You must obtain authorisation to reproduce such material from the copyright holders concerned. For further
guidance on a range of copyright issues, see the Office of Public Sector Information (OPSI) web site:
www.opsi.gov.uk/advice/crown-copyright/copyright-guidance/index.htm

or write to: OPSI, 102 Petty France, London SW1H 9AJ.
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